
Cantaloupes & Melons
CA59‐50 ‐ Early Valencia Melon Seeds

90 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Early Valencia Melon. The plant produces
good yields of melons with dark green skin.
It has the shape of a coconut. The flesh is
white and sweet. Good storage keeps for 4
months. Excellent choice for home gardens.
An heirloom variety dating back to the 1830s
and thought to come from Italy.

 

CA60‐50 ‐ Late Valencia Melon Seeds

115 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Late Valencia Melon. The plant produces
good yields of melons with dark green skin.
It has the shape of a coconut. The flesh is
white and sweet. Good storage keeps for 4
months. Excellent choice for home gardens.
Similar to the Malta Melon grown by
Jefferson in the gardens at Monticello. An
heirloom variety dating back to the 1830s
and thought to come from Italy.

CA55‐20 ‐ Rugoso di Cosenza Giallo Melon Seeds

100 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Rugoso di Cosenza Giallo Melon. The plant
produces good yields of 4 to 6 lb yellow
oval‐shaped melons. The flesh is light pale
green which is very sweet, creamy, juicy,
and tasty. Excellent for desserts, fruit
salads, cold soups, and smoothies. Great for
field or greenhouse production. An excellent
choice for home gardens and market
growers. A variety from Italy.
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