
Cantaloupes & Melons
CA48‐50 ‐ Amish Melon Seeds

90 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Amish Melon. The plant produces high yields
of 4 to 7 lb cantaloupes. The sweet orange
flesh is very juicy and has a muskmelon
flavor. It does well in most regions of the
United States, even in extreme heat. Heat
Tolerant. An excellent choice for home
gardens. An heirloom variety from the Amish
community.

 

CA31‐50 ‐ Casaba Golden Beauty Melon Seeds

90 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Casaba Golden Beauty Melon. The plant
produces good yields of 6 to 8 lb golden
cantaloupes with dark green mottling. The
melon has white flesh that is very sweet.
Stores well. Does well in hot dry climates.
Excellent choice for home gardens and
market growers. An heirloom variety dating
back to the 1920s. United States
Department of Agriculture, NSL 8514.

CA54‐50 ‐ Crenshaw Melon Seeds

112 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Crenshaw Melon. The plant produces heavy
yields of large 6 to 10 lb oval‐shaped melons
that mature to a yellowish‐green. It has a
salmon‐pink flesh that has a superb honey‐
sweet flavor. A variety that does best when
grown in warmer regions with dry climates.
Heat Tolerant. Drought Tolerant. Excellent
choice for home gardens. An heirloom was
introduced into the United States in 1929.

 

CA19‐50 ‐ Edisto 47 Melon Seeds

86 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Edisto 47 Melon. The plant produces good
yields of 4 ½ lb size cantaloupes. Its deep
salmon flesh is juicy and very delicious.
Excellent for hot, humid conditions and a
popular variety for the Southern states. Heat
Tolerant. High Humidity Tolerant. Excellent
choice for home gardens and market
growers. Developed Clemson University,
Blackville, South Carolina, USA. United
States Department of Agriculture, NSL 34600. Disease Resistant: ALS,
DM, PM.

CA26‐50 ‐ Imperial 45 Melon Seeds

1935 All‐America Selections Winner!

83 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Imperial 45 Melon. The plant produces
heavy yields of cantaloupes. They are very
sweet and have deep orange flesh. Keeps
well. Good shipper. Developed for hot and
humid regions. An excellent choice for home
gardens and market growers. United States
Department of Agriculture, NSL 5683.
Disease Resistant: PM.

 

CA57‐50 ‐ Piel de Sapo Melon Seeds

110 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Piel de Sapo Melon. The plant produces high
yields of 6 to 9 lb melons with green and
yellow skin. The flesh is a creamy white with
a tint of green and yellow color. It is very
aromatic, very sweet, and very juicy. This
Ananas melon has a pineapple‐like flavor.
Stores well. Excellent shipper. Does well in
hot and dry climates. Also known as Sharlyn
Melon. Excellent choice for home gardens
and market growers. An heirloom variety from Spain. United States
Department of Agriculture, AMES 5700.

Page 1 of 2  

https://www.reimerseeds.com//amish-melon-seeds.aspx
https://www.reimerseeds.com//casaba-golden-beauty-melon-seeds.aspx
https://www.reimerseeds.com//crenshaw-melon-seeds.aspx
https://www.reimerseeds.com//edisto-47-melon-seeds.aspx
https://www.reimerseeds.com//imperial-45-melon-seeds.aspx
https://www.reimerseeds.com//piel-de-sapo-melon-seeds.aspx
https://www.reimerseeds.com//top-mark-melon-seeds.aspx


CA34‐50 ‐ Top Mark Melon Seeds

90 days. Cucumis melo. Open Pollinated.
Top Mark Melon. The plant produces good
yields of 3 to 4 lb melons. The flesh is very
thick, firm, and deep salmon color. It has a
small seed cavity. Excellent shipper.
Tolerates hot dry climates. It does well in
the southern and southwestern regions of
the United States. One of the two best West
Coast cantaloupe varieties. An excellent
choice for home gardens and market
growers. An heirloom variety. United States Department of Agriculture,
NSL 30032. Disease Resistant: ALS, DM, PM, PRSV, S, WMV.
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